
Breakfast Club 

Breakfast Club is £1.50 per 

day. It is open from 7.30  —

8.15am. After 8.15am any 

child can attend free of 

charge. Free bagels are also  

given out  each  morning in 

the reception area. 

KS2 SATS 

From 21.1.19 SATS booster 

classes will be running  to  

ensure the children are fully 

prepared. A timetable has 

been sent home with your 

child. Please ensure they     

attend. 

Year 6 Trip to Knock        

Activity Centre in Eden Val-

ley. Year 6 children Have the    

opportunity to attend a 4 night 

outdoor  activity stay. The cost 

is £180 and includes           

canoeing, hill walking, mining 

and rock climbing. 

 

 

Miss Fountain and  

Mrs Robson 

Happy New Year!  

Welcome back to the new 
term. We hope you all had 
a fabulous Christmas and 
have settled well into our 
second  term. 

 

 

Attendance 

It is so important for your 
child to attend school every 
day. Please try to make   
medical appointments for  
outside of school hours 
and only book holidays 
when the school is closed. 
If your child is too ill to   
attend school then please     
inform the school office as 
soon as possible. The 
school doors close at 
8:50am. Please try to    
arrive before this time to  
prevent your child from  
being late. 

 

 

 

  

 

After School Clubs 

Clubs have started again 
for this term. If your child 
would like to take part in 
an after school club, 
please ask the office for a 
letter. 

Due to lack of interest we 
have cancelled Multi—
Sports on a Monday  eve-
ning. 

 

Number Day -1st Feb 
We will be celebrating the 
NSPCC Number Day on 
Friday 1st of Feb.  
Children can wear         
anything with a number 
on. There will be a range 
of number activities 
throughout the day. We 
are also incorporating  
Safer Internet Day into the 
mix and will have a range 
of activities linked to   
staying safe when on line. 
We are asking for         
donations of a £1 to go to 
NSPCC. 
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Reminder—
School doors 

close 8.50am 

February Half 

Term  

School closes on 
15th February 

and reopens on 
Tuesday 26th   
February. 

Class  

Assemblies 

1.2.19—6BW 

15.2.19—4/5NJ 

8.3.19—4/5ZD 

15.3.19—2ES 

22.3.19—1/2JD LW 

29.3.19—3CS 

5.4.19—1NH 

Y1/2JD & Y1NH 
Trip to Angel of 
the North - 

31.1.19 

Y3 Visit to    
Sunderland   

Museum and 
Winter   Gardens 
- 11.02.19 

School          
Photographs - 
7.2.19 

Mixed Y3/4 at 
Kwik Sticks  - 
23.02.19 

 

 


